GARDINER CITY COUNCIL

I AGENDA ITEM INFORMATION SHEET ;
veeting Date | 07/19/2023 oepartment | City Clerk |

Agenda Item |4g . Consideration of approval for a Victualers license for Cumberland Farms

Est. Cost |N/A
Please see attached information

Background Information

'I move to approve a victualers license for Cumberland Farms'
Requested

Action

City Manager
and/or
Finance Review

Council Vote/
Action Taken

Departmental
Follow-Up

1%t Reading Advertised

City

Gt 2" Reading Advertised

Use .
w/in 15 Days
Only / b

Final to Dept Updated Book Online
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Date Received in Office,

1 d nemmdby/@ﬁﬁ
AG mcr APPLICATION FOR A Office amount Recered SC)

AcOM

RENEWAL FOR 2023 LICENSE/BUSINESS/EVENT Approved Denred
Business Name | CUMBERLAND FARMS #5591
Business Location | 148 BRIDGE ST
Business Mailing Address |ATTN LEGAL DEPT 165 FLANDERS ROAD, WESTBOROUGH MA 01581
Owner Name | CUMBERLAND FARMS INC
Mailing Address (if different)
Phone Number | 508.270-1504
Business Number 207-533-0391 L
Emall Address| ME-RETA NSTNGGEC densoe)
Type of Business [CONVENIENCE STORE W/GAS STATION
Description of Business
{attach paper if necessary) mm mwcz%:%@mw
Type of License Being Apphied for {check all that apply)
Doing Business As (One-time Registration) $10
Special Event - Exhibitions & Shows (Minor) $50
€ | Special Event - Exhlbntlons & Shows {Major) $100
< | -] Street Sellers (Annual) i ‘ ' 350
treet Sellers {Per Event} S o | 820
i treet:Sellers { Farmer’s Market) (Annual] : e $10
= Te | lunkyatds (<100 ft ighway) (Anoual) : 15200
C_ | Junkyards (>100 ft highway) (Annual} $50
C | Automobile Recycling Business (S-year) $250
Other $
C | Victualers License to Sell Food (Annual} $50 |5000
C | Victualers License — One Day (Festval) $25
€ | Victualers Non-profit License to sell food (Annual) $10
C | Roving/On Wheels/Lunch Wagon (Annual) $160
C__| Roving/On Wheels/Lunch Wagon {Non-profit) $10
C | Roving/On Wheels/Lunch Wagon (3-Day) $25
C | Taxicabs/Vehicles for Hire $50
Sales {Special, QOB, etc) (Per Event/Sale) $25
Beano/Bingo/Games of Chance/Pinbali Machines {Annual) 510
Shooting Gallenes/Poo! Hall/Bowling Alley {Annual) $50
€ | Pawn {Annual) $50
€ | Tavern Keeper (Annual) $25
€ | Liquor/Bottle Club (1-50 seats) {Annual) $75
C | bguor/Bottle Club {51-100 seats) {Annual} $100
C | Liquor/Bottle Club {101+ seats) (Annual) $150
C | Catering Off-Premises {liquor 1s served) (per event) $10
C | Entertainment/Special Amusement License {Annual) $75
C | OQutside Consumption Permit {Annual) $25

Please send application and payment (payakle to City of Gardiner) to City Cleri’s Cffice, 6 Church Street, Gardiner, ME 04345




ardiner

Moving Forward

July 6, 2022

- License is hereby granted to:

Cumberland Farms #5591

License Includes:
‘Victualers

Within the City of Gardiner, Maine until May 31, 2023 next after the date hereof, subject to the
laws of the State of Maine and the ordinances, as revised, of the City of Gardiner.

e

Alistd Ballard, City Clerk

This License is NOT Transferable.

6 Church Street, Gardiner, Maine 04345 Alisha Baliord, City Clerk
Phone (207) 582-4200 [ fax (207) 582-6895 aballard@gardinermaine.com




America

165 FLANDERS ROAD
WESTEOROUGH, MA (1583
PHONE: (828) 200-6211

Vendor Name: CITY OF GARDINER TAX COLLECTOR

No. 648087

Verder No: 60858

Check Date: 05/30/2023
INVOICE NUMBER PURCHASE ORDER INVOICE DATE MERCHANDISE AMOUNT DISCOUNT AMOUNT NET AMOUNT
7258405 05/26/2023 50.00 0.00 50.00
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FLZAGE DETACH AND RETAIN THIS STATEMENT AS YOUR RECCRD OF PAYMENT. Thank You. | 50.00 0.00 50.00
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RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

Melissa Lindley

Mon 6/12/2023 957 AM

To:'Kathleen Cutler'. <KCutler@gardinermaine.com:; _umvm:Bm:ﬁImm% <departmentheads@gardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carlton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>; Kristopher McNaill -
<kmeneill @gardinermaine.coms>;

No issues with economic development.

Melissa Lindley

Economic Development Director & Public Information Officer
City of Gardiner.

6 Church Street, Gardiner, ME 04345

office: 207-582-4200 cell: 207-242-1907
miindley@gardinermaine.com

www.gardinermaine.com

From: Kathleen Cutler

Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 11:15 AM

To: DepartmentHeads <departmentheads@gardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carlton <ACarlton @mma_smﬂ:‘_m_:m com>; Kristopher McNeill
<kmecneili@gardinermaine.com>

Subject: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License



RE: Annual renewal Victualer's Wellness Connection

Dawn Thistle
Wed 6/28/2023 12:16 PM

To:'Kathleen Cuiler' <KCutler@gardinermaine.com>; DepartmentHeads <departmentheads@gardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carlton
<ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>; Kristopher McNeill <kmeneill @gardinermaine.com>;

No issues with the library.

From: Kathleen Cutler
Sent: Monday, June 26, 2023 2:59 PM
To: DepartmentHeads <departmentheads@gardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carfton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>;

Kristopher McNeill <kmcneill@gardinermaine.com>
Subject: Annual renewal Victualer's Wellness Connection

attached is the renewal application for the Wellness Connection for a victualer's license. Once approved, | will add

it to the meeting on July 19.




RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

Rick Sieberg
Fri 6/30/2023 12:58 PM

To:'Kathleen Cutler' <KCutler@gardinermaine.com>;

Kathy,

No problems for the FD.,

Rick Sieberg
Fire Chief | City of Gardiner
6 Church Street

C: 207-620-0217
p: 207-582-4535
e: rick.sieberg@gardinermaine.com

From: Kathleen Cutler

Sent: Friday, June 30, 2023 5:45 AM

To: Andrew Carlton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>; John Cameron <JCameron@gardinermaine.com>; Todd Pilsbury
<TPilsbury@gardinermaine.com>; Rick Sieberg <rick.sieberg@gardinermaine.com>

Subject: Fw: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

still need to hear from each of you on this one please.

From: Melissa Lindley
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 9:57 AM
To: 'Kathleen Cutler'; DepartmentHeads; Andrew Carlton; Kristopher McNeill

Subject: RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License
No Issues with economic development.

Melissa Lindley

Economic Development Director & Public Information Officer
City of Gardiner

§ Church Street, Gardiner, ME 04345

office: 207-582-4200 cell: 207-242-1907
mlindley@gardinermaine.com

www.gardinermaine.com
From: Kathleen Cutler
Sent: Friday, June 9, 2023 11:15 AM

Ta* Nanartmentieadc edenartmenthaads@@eardinermaine caoms>: Andrew Carlian <cACarlinn@oardinermaine rom>:




RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

Todd Pilsbury

Fri 6/30/2023 11:38 AM

To:Kathleen Cutler' <KCutler@gardinermaine.com>;

‘No issue with PD.

From: Kathleen Cutler

Sent: Friday, June 30, 2023 9:45 AM
To: Andrew Carlton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>; John Cameron <JCameron@gardinermaine.com>; Todd Pilsbury

- <TPilsbury@gardinermaine.com>; Rick Sieberg <rick.sieberg@gardinermaine.com>
Subject: Fw: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

still need to hear from each of you on this one please.

From: Melissa Lindley
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 9:57 AM
To: 'Kathleen Cutler'; DepartmentHeads; Andrew Carlton; Kristopher McNeill

Subject: RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License
No issues with economic development.

Melissa Lindley

Economic Development Director & Pubic Information Officer
City of Gardiner

6 Church Street, Gardiner, ME (4345

office: 207-582-4200 cell: 207-242-1907

miindley@gardinermaine.com
www.gardinermaine.com

From: Kathleen Cutler
Sent: Friday, June 8, 2023 11:15 AM

To: DepartmentHeads <@partmentheads@éardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carlton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.coms;
Kristopher McNeill <kmcneill@gardinermaine.com>

Subject: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License




Cumberland farms and backyard dogs

John Cameron

Fri 7/7/2023 9:40 AM

Deleted Items

To:Kathleen Cutler <KCutler@gardinermaine.com>;

-

There is no issues with public works for these licenses for some reason my email will not allow me to just reply to your original
email. It comes up your email is not valid for some reason.

Sent from my iPhone




Re: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

Andrew Carlton

Woed 7/5/2023 10:30 AM

To:Kathleen Cutler <KCutler@gardinermaine.coms;

Looks fine to me...

Andrew R. Carlton
Gardiner City Manager
& Church Street

207-582-4200

From: Kathleen Cutler

Sent: Friday, June 30, 2023 8:45:29 AM

To: Andrew Carlton; John Cameron; Todd Pilsbury; Rick Sieberg
Subject: Fw: Cumberfand Farms App for Victualers License

still need to hear from each of you on this one please.

From: Melissa Lindley

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 9:57 AM

To: 'Kathleen Cutler'; DepartmentHeads; Andrew Carlton; Kristopher McNeift
Subject: RE: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License

No issues with economic development.

Melissa Lindley

Economic Development Director & Public Information Officer
City of Gardiner

§ Church Street, Gardiner, ME 04345

office: 207-582-4200 celi; 207-242-1807
mlindley @gardinermaine.com

www.gardinermaine.com

From: Kathleen Cutler

Sent: Friday, june S, 2023 11:15 AM
To: DeparimentHeads <departmentheads@gardinermaine.com>; Andrew Carlton <ACarlton@gardinermaine.com>;
Kristopher McNeill <kmgeneill@gardinermaine.com>

Subject: Cumberland Farms App for Victualers License




